
 

It's a recent trend to post fake photos of actors and models online. A famous actress, Kajol Devgan was recently the victim of
these photoshoppers. The site she is signed to released a statement saying that "the picture in question has been sent to us by one
of our clients." It has since been confirmed that this photo is indeed fake. Unfortunately, this kind of thing isn't exactly new.
There are many other celebrities who have fallen victim to photoshopped pictures before it became trendy for people to do so.
Take a look below. Here is Aishwarya Rai Bachchan, in the same pose in several different photos in this article (yes, she's
actually posing like that). The photo was taken during an event in 2007. Here is Siddharth Mallya, brother of Kingfisher CEO
Vijay Mallya. It was reported earlier this year that he had passed away. He has since come out to state that the picture is
completely fake. He has even threatened legal action over the matter. This picture shows him at a beach party with several
friends and other people who are not dead. Here is Dino Morea, who is actually more active on Twitter these days. The picture
claiming to be him is actually of another man. His name is not known, but his picture has been used before by social media users
who are no longer with us. Dino Morea's fans have demanded that the photo be removed from the internet. This is Salman
Khan. He recently got married to his girlfriend Katrina Kaif after a long relationship with her. An image was released of the
couple on their wedding night, which turned out to be photoshopped . A lot of sites used this image of Salman Khan and Katrina
Kaif, some more innocently than others . Here is an image of another actress who has also fallen victim to the photoshoppers.
This image of Deepika Padukone was circulated recently on Facebook. It is obvious that the woman in the picture is not her.
Another young star who has fallen prey to these photo hackers is Shraddha Kapoor, seen here with her sister Karishma Kapoor.
The original image features both sisters smiling at the camera, without any editing or photoshopping. Not all celebrities are
victims of these fake photos, some are perpetrators . A picture of Ranbir Kapoor was posted online recently with his eyes
Photoshopped blue . The same thing had happened to another celebrity some time back . Here is a photo of Anushka Sharma
which was released by a popular news site. It turned out to be fake. This is a fake photo of Kareena Kapoor made to look like
she was speaking at a conference recently. The source of this fake pic has been tracedto the Karnataka chief minister's office .
However, it seems that no one in the government had actually confirmed her appearance for any conference, hence the picture
was definitely photoshopped. Another image that recently surfaced on social media showed Ratan Tata and Aishwarya Rai
Bachchan walking out of an aircraft together after reportedly getting engaged .
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